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H.S.Rai <hardeep.rai@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 20, 2015 at 9:05 AM
To: Suresh Ailawadi <asuresh.iitk@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,

Please refer http://www.nicee.org/npeee/CSIEducationalSoftware.pdf
Which says:

<quote>

A processing fees of Rs. 20,000/- is payable by the college/Institute
to NICEE by a cheque/draft in

favour of "National Information Centre of Earthquake Engineering"
alongwith the application.

Outstations cheques will be accepted and may include an additional
amount of Rs. 95/-. The

amount can also be paid online using a credit card at
www.nicee.org/NICEE_donation.php

mentioning the purpose as "SAP/ETABS"

</quote>
Does this offer still better and is the best one?

Does it mean we need to pay of Rs. 20,000/- per year to NICEE? Is it
donation to NICEE every year or toward cost of software going to CSI?

With regards,

Prof. (Dr.) H.S.Rai

Dean Testing and Consultancy http://gndec.ac.in/tcc/
Guru Nanak Dev Engg. College http://gndec.ac.in/
Ludhiana (Pb) India

http://gndec.ac.in/~hsrai/

http://hs.raiandrai.com

Please consider your environmental responsibility before printing this
e-mail - Save paper

Suresh Ailawadi <asuresh.iitk@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 20, 2015 at 9:30 AM
To: "H.S.Rai" <hardeep.rai@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,



The current processing charge is Rs. 20,000/- for SAP & ETABS. This can be
increased anytime. This is not the cost of the software but only the processing fee being
charged by NICEE. There are no further charges payable. You would get a licence for 10
users for 1 year only. For next year, the case will have to be processed again along with
the processing charges prevalent at that time.

Thanks & regards,

[Quoted text hidden]

Suresh Ailawadi

Consultant

National Information Centre of Earthquake Engineering
Department of Civil Engineering

Indian Institute of Technology Kanpur

Kanpur - 208 016

0512 - 259 7749 (O)

0512 - 259 8618 (R)

09450162502 (M)

H.S.Rai <hardeep.rai@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 20, 2015 at 7:39 PM
To: prashant garg <prashant.ced@gmail.com>

Cc: HoD Civil <civil@gndec.ac.in>

Bcc: Jagada Jha <jagadanand@gmail.com>, singh harpal <hps_bhoday@yahoo.com>,
harvinder singh <hvs1221@gmail.com>

@ Prof Prashant Garg

We can have 10 copies of SAP and ETAB for 1 year for Rs. 20,000/-
which is good for software training, in my opinion.

Payment may be made from "Consultancy Cell". Case may be initiated if
you find it appropriate.

[Quoted text hidden]

[Quoted text hidden]

H.S.Rai <hardeep.rai@gmail.com> Tue, Jan 20, 2015 at 7:40 PM
To: Suresh Ailawadi <asuresh.iitk@gmail.com>

On Tue, Jan 20, 2015 at 9:30 AM, Suresh Ailawadi <asuresh.iitk@gmail.com> wrote:
>

> For next year, the case will have to be processed again along with the
> processing charges prevalent at that time.

Thank you.
[Quoted text hidden]

Suresh Ailawadi <asuresh.iitk@gmail.com> Sat, Feb 21, 2015 at 4:14 PM
To: "H.S.Rai" <hardeep.rai@gmail.com>

Dear Sir,



